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2018 Strategic Plan Overview



2018 Strategic Plan: The BIG VISION



2018 Strategic Plan: PILLARS



Exercise

In small groups, we are 
going to discuss some of 
the key initiatives that were 
identified as potentially 
having Campus Master Plan 
impacts.

Key initiatives are 
highlighted with a red box.



Exercise

Step 1:

For each new Strategic 
Plan pillar, we will assign 
someone to read the 
overview



Exercise

Step 2:

As a group, discuss selected 
key initiatives and sub-
initiatives related to the 
focus groups present in 
each meeting.



Exercise

Step 3:

Specific topics include the 
physical, policy, program, 
technology, and wildcard
implications of each 
initiative.

Designated stakeholders will 
be tasked with recording 
group thoughts for each 
topic onto sticky notes and 
placing them onto the board.



Exercise

Targeted Outcome:

Additional feedback and 
direction on how the 
Master Plan can support 
key Strategic Plan 
initiatives from all Pillars 
that can be brought to the 
Steering Committee



THANK YOU!
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